

OCEANA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2023

ANNUAL SUPPLY BID TABULATION

OCEANA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION 2023 ANNUAL SUPPLY BID TABULATION

AGGREGATES

ITEM (Delivered)	Beckman Brothers			Ken Adams Excavating Inc.			Rieth Riley Construction Co.		
	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	QTY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE
2NS Hart	52	TON	\$7.50	52	TON	\$12.00	TON	No Bid	
Winter Sand Hart	52	TON	\$6.50	52	TON	\$7.00	TON	No Bid	
22A Hart	52	TON	\$14.95	52	TON	\$18.00	TON	\$19.50	
23A Hart	52	TON	\$14.85	52	TON	\$18.00	TON	\$19.50	
25A Slag Hart	TON			TON			TON	\$34.50	
29A Slag Hart	TON			TON			TON	No Bid	
H1 or 32FA Limestone Hart	TON			TON			TON	\$28.90	
34CS Slag Hart	TON			TON			TON	No Bid	
2NS M20	28	TON	\$6.50	TON			TON	No Bid	
Winter Sand M20	28	TON	\$5.25	52	TON	\$12.00	TON	No Bid	
22A M20	TON			52	TON	\$18.00	TON	\$19.50	
23A M20	TON			52	TON	\$18.00	TON	\$19.50	
25A Slag M20	TON			TON			TON	\$35.50	
29A Slag M20	TON			TON			TON	No Bid	
H1 or 32FA Limestone M20	TON			TON			TON	\$29.65	
34CS Slag M20	TON			TON			TON	No Bid	
<b>Material to be Picked up</b>									
2NS (location) <b>M-20</b>	TON		\$6.00	TON			TON	No Bid	
Winter Sand (location) <b>M-20</b>	TON		\$4.00	TON			TON	No Bid	
22A (location) <b>Hesperia/Baker/M-20</b>	TON		\$9.75	<b>YARD</b>		\$14.00	TON	\$19.50	
23A (location) <b>Hesperia/Baker/M-20</b>	TON		\$9.75	<b>YARD</b>		\$14.00	TON	\$19.50	
25A (location)	TON		No Bid	TON			TON	No Bid	
29A (location)	TON		No Bid	TON			TON	No Bid	
Rip Rap Plain (location)	TON		No Bid	TON			TON	\$65.00	
<b>Materials Spread Directly Onto Roadway</b>									
22A Spread onto North County Road	28	TON	\$16.90	TON			TON	\$19.50	
22A Slag Spread onto North County	TON		No Bid	TON			TON	\$21.95	
23A Spread onto North County Road	28	TON	\$16.90	TON			TON	\$19.50	
22A Spread onto South County Road	28	TON	\$16.90	TON			TON	\$19.50	
22A Slag Spread onto South County	TON		No Bid	TON			TON	\$22.45	
23A Spread onto South County Road	28	TON	\$16.90	TON			TON	\$19.50	

OCEANA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION 2023 ANNUAL SUPPLY BID TABULATION

AGGREGATES

ITEM (Delivered)	Verplank Trucking Co.		Yellow Rose Transport		QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE	
2NS Hart	TON	\$19.75	TON	No Bid	TON	TON
Winter Sand Hart	TON	\$19.75	TON	No Bid	TON	TON
22A Hart	TON	\$17.25	1	TON \$20.85	TON	TON
23A Hart	TON	\$17.25	2	TON \$22.60	TON	TON
25A Slag Hart	TON	\$44.00	TON	\$35.00	TON	TON
29A Slag Hart	TON	\$59.00	TON	\$40.00	TON	TON
H1 or 32FA Limestone Hart	TON	\$32.00	TON	\$29.60	TON	TON
34CS Slag Hart	TON	\$59.00	TON	\$41.00	TON	TON
2NS M20	TON	\$19.50	TON	No Bid	TON	TON
Winter Sand M20	TON	\$19.50	TON	No Bid	TON	TON
22A M20	TON	\$17.00	1	TON \$20.85	TON	TON
23A M20	TON	\$17.00	2	TON \$22.60	TON	TON
25A Slag M20	TON	\$43.75	TON	\$35.00	TON	TON
29A Slag M20	TON	\$58.75	TON	\$40.00	TON	TON
H1 or 32FA Limestone M20	TON	\$31.75	TON	\$29.60	TON	TON
34CS Slag M20	TON	\$58.75	TON	\$41.00	TON	TON
<b>Material to be Picked up</b>						
2NS (pit location)	TON	No Bid	TON	No Bid	TON	TON
Winter Sand (location)	TON	No Bid	TON	No Bid	TON	TON
22A (location)	TON	No Bid	TON	No Bid	TON	TON
23A (location)	TON	No Bid	TON	No Bid	TON	TON
25A (location)	TON	No Bid	TON	No Bid	TON	TON
29A (location)	TON	No Bid	TON	No Bid	TON	TON
Rip Rap Plain (location)	TON	No Bid	TON	No Bid	TON	TON
<b>Materials Spread Directly Onto Roadway</b>						
22A Spread onto North County Road	TON	\$18.75	TON	No Bid	TON	TON
22A Slag Spread onto North County	TON	\$20.35	TON	\$22.25	TON	TON
23A Spread onto North County Road	TON	\$18.75	1	TON \$25.00	TON	TON
22A Spread onto South County Road	TON	\$17.50	TON	No Bid	TON	TON
22A Slag Spread onto South County	TON	\$19.10	TON	\$21.30	TON	TON
23A Spread onto South County Road	TON	\$17.50	TON	\$23.00	TON	TON

<sup>1</sup>Slag

<sup>2</sup>Limestone

OCEANA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION 2023 ANNUAL SUPPLY BID TABULATION

BRINE

		Michigan Chloride Sales, LLC					
		Brine and Processed Dust Control		Product Minimum 19% CaCl2			
ITEMS	Natural (26%-29%)	Other	30%-33%	34%-38%	Modified	26%-29%	34%-38%
DELIVERED TO TANKS							
% OF Calcium Chlorides	19-21%		32%	38%	Boost <sup>1</sup>	28% <sup>1</sup>	35% <sup>1</sup>
% of Total Chlorides	26%	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
F.O.B. Hart Tanks	\$ .21 /gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
F.O.B. M20 Tanks	\$ .21 /gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>APPLIED TO ROADS</b>							
Application rate per mile (2 lane road)	2,500 gal/mi	2,000 gal/mi	2,000 gal/mi	2,000 gal/mi			2,000 gal/mi
NW quadrant of county	\$ .30 /gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NE quadrant of county	\$ .30 /gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
SW quadrant of county	\$ .30 /gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
SE quadrant of county	\$ .30 /gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

<sup>1</sup> Price Includes three (3) Frac Tanks for the period of 5/1/23 through 9/30/23. Terms: Net 30. Unloading time charges: 1st hour Free, \$100 per additional hour or portion thereof.

OCEANA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION 2023 ANNUAL SUPPLY BID TABULATION

BRINE

Great Lakes Chloride, Inc						
Brine and Processed Dust Control		Product Minimum 19% CaCl2				
Natural (26%-29%)	Other	30%-33%	34%-38%	Modified	26%-29%	34%-38%
				\$0.96		
19-21%		32%	38%	Boost	28%	35%
			38%			
			\$0.573			
			\$0.591			
			\$0.666			
2,500 gal/mi		2,000 gal/mi	2,000 gal/mi			2,000 gal/mi

<b>ITEMS</b>
DELIVERED TO TANKS
% OF Calcium Chlorides
% of Total Chlorides
F.O.B. Hart Tanks
F.O.B. M20 Tanks
<b>APPLIED TO ROADS</b>
Application rate per mile (2 lane road)
NW quadrant of county
NE quadrant of county
SW quadrant of county
SE quadrant of county

OCEANA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION 2023 ANNUAL SUPPLY BID TABULATION

BITUMINOUS MIXTURES - HOT & COLD

Item	Ace-Saginaw Paving Co.			Asphalt Paving Inc.			Lakeland Asphalt Corp.		
	Min Qty	Unit	Unit Price	Min Qty	Unit	Unit Price	Min Qty	Unit	Unit Price
Bit Mix 13A Location		TON	No Bid	none	TON	\$79.50	N/A	TON	No bid
Bit Mix 36A Location		TON	No Bid	none	TON	\$79.50	N/A	TON	No bid
Bit Mix Commercial Top Location		TON	No Bid	none	TON	\$79.50	N/A	TON	No bid
Bit Mix Commercial Base Location		TON	No Bid	none	TON	\$79.50	N/A	TON	No bid
Bit Mix Court Mix Location		TON	No Bid	none	TON			TON	
CP5 Delivered Hart		TON	No Bid		TON			TON	No bid
CP 7 Delivered Hart		TON	No Bid		TON			TON	No bid
*Hi Quality (describe) delivered Hart	* 50	TON	\$135.00	*	TON	\$130.00	50*	TON	\$135.00
					Muskegon			CP7 equivalent	
Cold Patch Delivered Hart		TON			TON			TON	

\* <sup>1</sup>QPR High Performance

\* <sup>2</sup>CP6 Cold Patch - Muskegon  
Statite - pick up

\* <sup>3</sup>BMP-7 Limestone

OCEANA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION 2023 ANNUAL SUPPLY BID TABULATION

BITUMINOUS MIXTURES - HOT & COLD

Item	Min Qty	Unit	Unit Price	Rieth - Riley Construction Co.	Unique Paving Materials	
	Min Qty	Unit	Unit Price	Min Qty	Unit	Unit Price
Bit Mix 13A		TON		TON	TON	
Location	3566 Mill Creek, Comstock Park			Ludington		
Bit Mix 36A		TON		TON	TON	
Location	3566 Mill Creek, Comstock Park			Ludington		
Bit Mix Commercial Top		TON		TON	TON	
Location	3566 Mill Creek, Comstock Park			Ludington		
Bit Mix Commercial Base		TON		TON	TON	
Location	3566 Mill Creek, Comstock Park			Ludington		
Bit Mix Court Mix		TON		TON	TON	
Location						
CP5 Delivered Hart		TON		N/A	TON	
CP 7 Delivered Hart		TON		50	TON	
*Hi Quality (describe) delivered Hart		TON			TON	
					50	\$146.70
					to Hart	
					50	\$143.47
					to M20/New Era	
Cold Patch Delivered Hart		TON		TON	TON	

Prices may not be firm for the duration of the bid

<sup>1</sup> Bond X  
<sup>2</sup> UPM cold mix  
<sup>3</sup> Delivered to M20 Garage & New Era \$106.85

\*Please schedule in advance. Both Hot & Cold Mixes to be Picked Up at Ludington Plant

No Minimum

OCEANA COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION 2023 ANNUAL SUPPLY BID TABULATION

# BRIDGE DECKS

Krenn Timber Bridge Corp			
Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Extension
	MBM	\$6,174.87	
	MBM	\$9,231.48	
	MBM	\$10,206.17	
	MBM	\$8,371.34	
	MBM	\$9,747.47	
	MBM	\$10,550.20	
	MBM	\$10,550.20	
	MBM	\$11,238.28	
	MBM	\$12,843.73	
	Pound	\$20.47	

F.O.B. job site, truck lots. 60-90 days delivery. One million dollar liability insurance to cover product and/or design.

Bid firm one year/renewable at option of bidder.

\*5% market fluctuation clause.

Prices include design drawings sealed by Registered MI Engineer.

Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Extension
	MBF		
	MBF		
	MBF		
	MBF		
	Pound		

We install wooden bridges & steel sheeting.

Price depends on the job.

Item
Treated SYP Bridge Planking
Timber Box Culvert
Transverse Decking 4", 6" & 8"
Treated Bridge and Salt Timbers
Panelized Bridge Decks, Longitudinal to 12"
Panelized Bridge Decks, Longitudinal to 14"
Panelized Bridge Decks, Logitudinal to 16"
Panelized Bridge Decks, Logitudinal to 18"
Panelized Bridge Decks, Logitudinal to 20"
Hardware



# CULVERTS

## ALL PIPE AND BANDS MUST BE ALUMINIZED TYPE 2

ITEM
12" - 16 ga CSP
15" - 16 ga CSP
18" - 16 ga CSP
24" - 14 ga CSP
30" - 14 ga CSP
36" - 14 ga CSP
12" - 16 ga CSP Band (12" wide)
15" - 16 ga CSP Band (12" wide)
18" - 16 ga CSP Band 24" Length
24" - 14 ga CSP Band 24" Length
30" - 14 ga CSP Band 24" Length
36" - 14 ga CSP Band 24" Length
Minimum Truck Capacity in Pounds

Cadillac Culvert Inc.				
Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Alum	Galv
	ft	\$10.30		
	ft	\$12.75		
	ft	\$15.25		
	ft	\$25.50		
	ft	\$32.45		
	ft	\$38.40		
	each	\$15.45		
	each	\$19.10		
	each	\$30.00		
	each	\$48.00		
	each	\$64.00		
	each	\$74.00		
		N/A		

Prices include full truck delivery to yard or jobsite. Less than truck load quantities, freight charges may apply. Aluminumized Type 2  
1% 10 Net 30.

Jensen Bridge & Supply Co.			
Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Extension
	ft	\$10.23	
	ft	\$12.36	
	ft	\$14.87	
	ft	\$26.19	
	ft	\$33.20	
	ft	\$38.73	
	each	\$17.90	
	each	\$21.63	
	each	\$29.74	
	each	\$52.38	
	each	\$66.40	
	each	\$77.46	

St Regis Culvert Inc.			
Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Extension
	ft	\$13.00	
	ft	\$15.60	
	ft	\$19.50	
	ft	\$31.20	
	ft	\$39.00	
	ft	\$46.80	
	each	\$21.50	
	each	\$25.75	
	each	\$39.00	
	each	\$62.40	
	each	\$78.00	
	each	\$97.60	
		N/A	

Minimum order to include freight is \$7,500.00. FOB Oceana County. Prices firm for 30 days from bid date. Less than said amount add \$500.  
Discount: 1% Net 10

